
RESOLUTION NO. Ot,,-1::/_ 
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, OHIO 

SPONSORED BY COUNCILMEMBER ( t!,,_uf} c~1r1 

i'7#. DAY OF ;/-r:.bt.uo/l , 2014. 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BIDS 
SUBMITTED BY TRUPOINTE, JOHN DEERE 
LANDSCAPES, MIDWEST TURF CONSULTANTS, 
RESIDEX, GREEN VELVET SOD FARMS, AND THE 
HILL COMPANY FOR FERTILIZER FOR THE GOLF 
CLUB AT YANKEE TRACE AND TO AUTHORIZE THE 
CITY MANAGER TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACT IN 
CONNECTION THEREWITH. 

ON THE 

WHEREAS, the City of Centerville advertised for bidders for 
fertilizer for The Golf Club at Yankee Trace according to specifications prepared 
by the City, and 

WHEREAS, John Deere Landscapes, Midwest Turf Consultants, 
Residex, Green Velvet Sod Farms, and The Hill Company were the lowest and 
best bidders on various products. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE 
HEREBY RESOLVES: 

Section 1. That the following bids totaling $26,828.13 are hereby accepted 
for fertilizers for The Golf Club at Yankee Trace, are marked as Exhibits "A," 
"B," "C," '"D," "E," and "F" are attached hereto and made a part hereof: 

A. Trupointe - $2,660 - 200 bags of 30-0-6 50% slow release. 

B. John Deere - $5,988.33 - 230 bags of Andersons 15-0-4 Merit 0.2 
(alt) at $3,822.83; 305 gallons of Iron +Chelated ZN (alt) at 
$2,165.50. 

C. Midwest Turf Consultants - $1,020.80 - 8 acres of Aerification 
Recovery. 

D. Residex - $5,140.80 - 340 bags of 25-0-5 80%NSN (alt). 

E. Green Velvet- $10,198.20 - 40 bags of Andersons 18-9-18 at 
$2,116.00; 502 bags of 12-0-3+ .15% Dim at $8,082.20. 



F. Hill Company - $1,820.00 - 65 gallons of Gary's Green 18-3-4 
+Iron. 

Section 2. The City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter into 
any necessary contracts to evidence acceptance of said bids and to make payment 
pursuant thereto. 

2014. 
PASSED this __ /_'J-_U--___ day;: -j_,L~~ , 

e y/eJJ .L-:'~~~ 
Mayoi of the City 

1

~hio 

ATTEST: 

Clerk of Council, City of C 

CERTIFICATE 

The undersigned, Clerk of the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio 
hereby certifies that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution 
Number_ 0_&=../L, passed by the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio on the 

rrtL day of 4-e fu\.UAN~ 2014. 
() 

Clerk of Council 

Approved as to fonn, consistency with 
existing ordinances, the Charter and 
Constitutional Provisions. 

Department of Law 
Scott A. Liberman 
Municipal Attorney 



mkee Trace Golf Course Chemlcal &Fertilizer B 
Submitted for February 5, 2014 Submitted by: 

City Manager 
City of Centerville 

100 West Spring Valley Road 
Centerville, Ohio 45458 

Contact ~ame: Terry Taylor 

Chemicals 

Quantity Size Description 
30 gl Aqua Smart F 
35 gl Aqua Smart G.T. 
20 gl Armor Tech 44 

Chlorothalonil 
350 lb O.F. 

215 gl Chlorothalonil F. 

200 gl lprodlone 

30 gl Primo 

20 gl Proplconazole 

15 gl Proxy 

64 oz Quicksilver 

5 gl Round Up 

10 gl Secure 

25 gl Tartan 
Thlophanate-

70 gl methyl 
Millennium Ultra 

35 gl II 

5 gl Seven 
Fertilizers 

25-0-9 80 % Slow 
340 50# release SGN 150 

Andersons 18-~ 
·- --·· ·------· --

Sales Person: 

TrfCure AD 
TrlCureAD 
PhyteOff 
Echo Ultimate 
82.SWDG 

Echo 720 
lprodlone SPC 2F 
(Nufarm) 

Groom PGR 
(Trinexapac-

ethyl) 
NuFarrn 
(proplconlzole 
14.3) 

In 8 oz container 
Ranger Pro 
(Monsanto) 

Tee-Off 4.SF 

NuFarm 
Carbary! 4L 
(Drexel) 

Spring Valley 
item #2253538 

24-0-12 SGN 150 
100% Regain 

Trupointe Turf & Ornamentals 

818 South US 42 
P.O. Box 117 
Lebanon, OH 45036 
Bob Lachance (60220) 

Unit Price Extended Price 
$91.65 $2,749.49 
$91.65 $3,207.74 
$20.28 $405.65 

$4.92 $1,721.18 

$25.80 $5,547.44 

$51.19 $10,238.91 

$131.04 $3,931.33 

$66.67 $1,333.33 

$45.07 $676.11 

$15.18 $971.38 

$20.19 $100.97 

$540.00 $5,400.00 

$440.00 $11,000.00 

$59.86 $4,190.44 

$66.28 $2,319.72 

$48.78 $243.89 

$18.60 $6,324.23 



Andersons 15-0-4 Spring Valley 
Merit .2 259' slow item # 2246950 

230 SO# SGN215 15-0-5 25" xcu $20.77 $4,776.71 

13-2-S + .15 13-0-0 .15 
Dimension 30" Dimension 100" 

502 50# slow release Regain (SGN 150) $17.66 $8,865.73 

' 30-0-6 so" slow 30-0-6 50% slow 
200 SO# release SGN215 release SGN 215 $13.30 $2,660.00 
so gl Micros plus Prolific 5-0-0 $11.30 $565.00 

Aerificatfon 
8 Acres Recovery $0.00 

6 Iron 
305 gl 12-0-0 Fe & Zn (Agrisolutlons) $8.93 $2,724.67 

Garry's Green 18-
65 gl 3-4 

Total $81,592.13 



D JOHN DEERE 
LANDSCAPES 

'NastCanolllllnOHt530 
730 Royal Ridge Or 
West Clm>IIIDn OH -15448-2334 
w. (937)811M252 

Cr.tad Quotatl DueDatll 

01/291201-4 1955970 02/051201-4 

Prlntad Job Name 

02/04/2014 2014 Fartlllzar 
21:55:03 Bid 

Line Item Item 
# # Desc 

ExpedadAwald 
Data 

02/11/2014 

Job 
Desc:rfDllon 
2014 Fartillzer 
Bfd 

24-3-12M BO% POLYPLUS 1FE 
1 510148 ltemNom: 

Bid Item 1 SGN 150 

Quotation 

Expiration 
Dabt 

10131/2014 

!Job start 
Oabt 

01/2912014 

BIii To: 
CllY OF CENTERVIU..E OBA TI-IE GOLF CLUB AT 
YANKEE TR, ('60055D) 
100 W Spring Valley Pike 
Dayton, OH 45458-3760 
W: (937)428-4745 
Ship To: 

CllY OF CENTERVILLE OBA 11-tE GOLF CLUB AT 
YANKEE TR ('600550) 
100 W Spring V..., Pb 
Dayton, OH 45458-3780 
W: (937)428-4745 

Qty Unit Extended 
Price Price 

34(] 23.144 7,868.96 

COUNTRYCLUB 18-3-1BE65% CRN SOP 1.5Fe0.5MN 
2 090727 Item Hom: 40 38.998 1,559.92 

Bid /tam 2 SGN 100 
MERIT .2% 14-0-0 20% SCU 

3 091533 ltemNom: 23D 18.621 3,822.83 
Bld/tam3 
30-0-8 50% POLYPUJS 2FE 

4 510203 ltamNola: 200 15.824 3,164.80 
8/dlfllm.f 
DIMENSION 0.15% 13-o-W 30%POL YPLUS SOI LESCO 

5 ~18 lmmNom: 502 18.832 8,449.66 
Bldllsm 5 

8 No Bid 119mNom: 
Bldlfllm5 
IRON+ CHBATED ZN 2.5 GAL 

7 084050 ltamNom: 122 17.750 2,185.50 
8/ditMI 7 

GREEN FLO 18-3-8 50%CRN 2.5 GAL 
8 052447 119m Not.: 28 27.8511 724.33 

BldltemB 

Total Price: $27,756.00 

Qmalp,alafarnaalllrn,. ~--•--bect,qajwlWI ~ Mpmb:land~Wannaaanlel-s111 .. ,_.lnlllrnlalan__...n 
ilUjmlltcn.,gawllmulnalmarmllglllan. 



dwest - . 
TUii CONSULTANTS 

Bid Proposal for Fertlitzer at The Golf Club at Yankee Trace. 

January 24, 2014 

Presented by: 

Eric Groth 
President 
Midwest Turf Consultants, LLC 
1003 Distribution Drive 
Suite B 
Columbus, OH 43228 
614-395-0943 
egroth@rrohlo.com 

Product Prices: 
1. EC Grow Prollnks 22-0-11 Standard Grade Fertlllzer 1S0 SGN In SO pound bags-$22.00 per bag. 
2. Plant Science Tru Prlll 18-0-18 micro 90 SGN dlspersable with IBDU In SO pound bags - $50.00 

per bag. 
3. Pro Tea Aeriflcatlon Recovery Program 4 product nutritional program for greens recovery • 

(lndlvldual product descriptions provlded)-$127.60 per acre. 

\ 

4. Pro Tea Green Iron 12-0-0 with Fe liquid nutrient In 275 gallon tote and 2x2.S gallon cases - \ 
$12.00 per gallon. 

S. Pro Tea Synltro 23 23-0-0 foliar nutrient In 2x2.S gallon cases - $23.00 per gallon. 

Terms: Net 30 days from Invoice, freight Included In quote price. 



-
Midwest Turf Consultants 

Fertilizer Bid For Yankee Trace GC 
Current Product Quantity Unit SGN Alternative Product Quantity Unit SGN Cost/Unit Total Cost 
25-0-9 80% Slow Release 340 SO# Bag 150 EC Grow 22-0-11 340 SO# Bag 150 $22.00 $7,480.00 
Andersons 18-9-18 OG 40 40# Bag 90 Tru Prlll 18-0-18. 32 SO#Bag 90 $50.00 $1,600.00 
Ander 15-0~ Merit 0.2 230 SO# Bag 215 
30-0-6 so~ Slow Release 200 SO# Bag 215 
12-0-3 DIM .15 25% SR 502 50# Bag 150 
Aerification Recovery 8 Acres Liquid Aerificatlon Recovery 8 Acres Liquid $127.60 $1,020.80 
12-0-0 ZN 305 Gallon Liquid Green Iron 305 Gallon Liquid $12.00 $3,660.00 

Garys Green 65 Gallon Uquld Synltro 23 65 Gallon Liquid $23.00 $1,495.00 

$15,255.80 

Tru Prill 18-0-18 is In a 50# bag, so only 32 bags are required 
Aerlflcatlon Recovery consists ofTru Pro, Par 5, Synltro 23 and Long Green 

• 

_,- ..,,. ,. 
~ '!• ,•> •• ::•1~ .. '(.:" ":r.rJ:: , •~--■T...,,__ ~R=~~- _;. ...... •• ••- -- -•-•••• •~-• .:- ... ".~':1~:_~T""L•.-•·_.•~' : ,•' ~ •• _.., .... ;~«~:'; •-:--;~. ?""'""-•-=--- .;..:;~.:.::,~.:t :~~; 



-d . S I' ex· BrucelonesQUOTE FORM 
Cell 614-507-2603 

5865 HIGHLAND RIDGE OR. CINCINNATI, OHIO 45232 fax 513-242-4444 

E-mail BJONES@RESIDEX.COM 

DATE TERMS SLS# BRUCEJ 
ACCOUNT# SHIP VIA 
PO# 214 fertlllzer bid SHIP DATE 

SOLD TO The Golf Club at Yankee Trace SHIP TO 
ADDRESS ioo West Spring Valley Rd ADDRESS 
CITY Centerville CITY 
STATE OHIO ZIP 45458 STATE OHIO ZIP 
PHONE# 937-623-6151 CONTACT 

QUANTilY UNIT ITEM NUMBER DECRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL 
340 SO# TGS25NFE5 (25-0-9 80'6 slow, sub 25-0-5 80'6NSN $ 15.12 $ 5,140.80 
40 SO# AGC181WMDG4 andersons 18-9-18 $ 52.90 $ 2,116.00 

230 SO# ATP15NMRS andersons 15-0-4 merit 0.2 $ 18.98 $ 4,365.40 
200 SO# 30-0-6 50"5low SEE SUB BELOW $ - $ -
200 SO# TGS30151 SUB 30-0-4 50" PCSCU $ 13.70 $ 2,740.00 
502 50# 12-0-3 DIM .15 25" SRN SEE BELOW $ - $ -
502 SO# AGC18DM5 18-3-12 • .164 " DIMENSION 25" NS4S SGN 150 $ 25.00 $ 12,550.00 

AERIFICATION RECOVERY 80 ACRES SEE BELOW $ - $ -
4 2X2.5 G AA1003 TURF FUEL ELEMENT 6 $ 175.00 $ 700.00 

61 2X2.S G CA408-250 TURF FUEL 12-0-0 PHOTO FUEL $ 180.00 $ 10,980.00 
GARRY$ GREEN 18-3-4 SEE BELOW $ - $ -

13 2X2.SG TURF FUEL 18-3-6 50% SRN $ 77.00 $ 1,001.00 

$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -
$ -

SUBTOTAL s 39,593.20 
SALES TAX 7% $ 2,771.52 

GRAND TOTAL $ 42,364.72 
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YANKEE TRACE GOLF COURSE FERTILIZER BID 2014 
FERTILIZER BID PRODUCTS 

25-0-9 80% NSN 1 % MG 1 % MN {san 150) 
18-9-18 Contee DG (Anderson DG) 
15-0-4 w/ Merit 25% nsn (san 215) 
30-0-6 50% XRT 
12-0-3 .15°/4 Dimension 25% SCU san 215 
12-0-0 w/ 6% FE 4% S 2% MN 
18-3-4 Nitroplast {alt Garv's Green) 

CRAIG FRYMAN 
937-603-8414 

V"""IVI 

baa 
baa 
baa 
baa 
baa 

aallon 
aallon 

'°'UQI ILILY VI '<II I r I 'UV'-

340 $21.39 
40 $52.90 
230 $19.20 
200 $15.90 
502 $16.10 
305 $10.35 
65 $34.30 

2/5/2014 

•-•ru ... 
$7,272.60 
$2.116.00 
$4,416.00 
$3,180.00 
$8,082.20 
$3,156.75 
$2,229.50 

$30,453.05 

~ 
'S" -e-· 
+' 
m 



Fertilizers 

25-0-9 80% Slow Release 
Andersons 18-9-18 
Andersons 15-0-4 Merit 0.2 
30-0-6 50% Slow Release 

The Golf Club at Yankee Trace 
2014 Fertilizer Bid Request 

Bid Prepared by Jim Dillard 
The Hill Company 

2 77 6 Circleport Drive 
Erlanger, KY 41018 
Ph: 859-815-8320 
Fax: 859-815-8322 

12-0-3 + Dim .15 25% Slow Release 
Aerifcatlon Recovery 

QTY 

340Bags 
40 Bags 
230Bags 
200Bags 
502 Bags 
BAcres 
305Gal 
65 Gal 

SGN 

150 
90 
215 
215 
150 

12-0-0 + Zinc 
Ganys Green 18-3-4 + Iron 

Total Bid = $1,820.00 

Enclosed: 10% Certified Check #327054- $182.00 

Bid Price 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
$70.00/2.S gal each 


