
RESOLUTION NO. O'rf -11 
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, OHIO 

SPONSORED BY COUNCILMEMBER ::001 i CtL-~L.- ON THE 
,?;od- DAY OF .:;/ d-uu,,r , _012. 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BIDS 
SUBMITTED BY TURFGRASS INC., 
ADVANCED TURF SOLUTIONS, THE HILL 
COMPANY, HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY, 
CENTURY EQUIPMENT, AND GREEN 
VELVET SOD FARMS FOR CHEMICALS FOR 
THE GOLF CLUB AT YANKEE TRACE AND 
TO AUTHORIZE THE CITY MANAGER TO 
ENTER INTO CONTRACTS IN CONNECTION 
HEREWITH. 

WHEREAS, the City of Centerville advertised for bidders for chemicals 
for The Golf Club at Yankee Trace according to specifications prepared by the 
City, and 

WHEREAS, Turfgrass Inc., Advanced Turf Solutions, The Hill Company, 
Helena Chemical Company, Century Equipment, and Green Velvet Sod Farms 
were the lowest and best bidders. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE 
HEREBY RESOLVES: 

Section 1. That the following bids totaling $55,335.20 are hereby 
accepted for chemicals for the Golf Club at Yankee Trace, marked as Exhibit 
'·A," ''B," "C," "D,"" E" and "F" attached hereto and made a part hereof: 

A. Turfgrass Inc., $3,525.90 including $3,218.40 for 50 gallons of 
Propicnazol; and $307.50 for 7.5 gallons of Proxy. 

B. Advanced Turf Solutions, $5,280.00 including $5,280.00 for the 
purchase of 384 oz of Acelpryn. 

C. The Hill Company, $17,279.30 including $2,400.00 for the purchase 
of 100 gallons of Armor Tech 44 (alt); $1,400.00 for 350 pounds of 
Clorothalonil D.G.; $1 ,596.30 for 66 pounds of Signature; and $ I 1,883.00 
for 25 gallons of Tartan. 

D. Helena Chemical Company, $22,209.00 including $4,128.00 for the 
purchase of 160 gallons of Clorothalonil F .; $8,180.00 for 200 gallons of 
Iprodione; $5,032.50 for 15 gallons of Mefenoxam; $936.00 for 64 oz of 



Quick Silver; $57.50 for 5 gallons Roundup (alt); and $3,875.00 for 70 
gallons Thiophanate Methyl. 

E. Century Equipment, $2,966.00 including $989.00 for 30 gallons of 
Aqua Smart F; and $1,977.00 for 35 gallons of Aqua Smart GT. 

F. Green Velvet Sod Farms, $4,075.00 including $4,075.00 for I 5 
gallons of Primo. 

Section 2. The City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter 
into any necessary contracts to evidence acceptance of said bids and to make 
payment pursuant thereto. 

Section 3. This resolution becomes effective at the earliest date allowed 
by law. 

PASSED this ).OiL day of .:;J.J,,_,.,.,a.M!I~ . 2012. 

C Mu>b~ 
Mayor of the Cit0,icnterville, Ohio 

ATTEST: 

-X>_e1, ~ a . Oevr~f.L.-' 
Clerk of Council, City(7'enterville, Ohio 

CERTIFICATE 

The undersigned, Clerk of the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio 
hereby certifies that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution 
Number O'b-1 :1 passed by the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio on the ,;io-c.. 
day of Ff,-- , 2012. 

·-:J)ulnc:_ u,·t~ 
Clerk of Council 

Approved as to form, consistency with 
existing ordinances, the Charter and 
Constitutional Provisions. 

Department of Law 
Scott A. Liberman 
Municipal Attorney 
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ResldeX-Turfgrass - - ~ r"'-
Price Quote 

____ _. __ .. ., 
Date: 2/8/2012 1r.~111r. ]I u(jn(r-

Prepared for: The Golf Club at Yankee Trace --·-----., 
46U5 HIIUBOlOTO~I\II: IIOVl, I.~ JBJ77 2J:S 

Description SGN/slze Unit 
Chemical Bid 

Aceleorvn 64oz EA 

Quickwater Plus (substitute for Aquasmart Fl 2.5gal EA 

Quickwater Plus (substitute for Aauasmart GT) 2.5gal EA 

Fairwav Phvte (substiture for Armor Tech 44} 2.5gal EA 

Chlorothalonil DF 10lb EA 

Chlorothalonil 720 (same as Chlorothalonil F) 2.5Qal EA 

Chipco 26019 (lprodione) 2.5aal EA 

Mef enoxam 2AQ 2.5gal EA 

Primo MAXX 1aal EA 

Prooiconazole Select 2.Sgal EA 

Proxv 2.5gal EA 

Quicksilver 8oz EA 

Round Uo Promax 1.67aal EA 

Signature 5.51b EA 

Unit Price Units 

$ 880.00 6 

$ 112.50 12 

$ 112.50 14 

$ 65.00 40 

$ 50.75 35 

$ 75.82 64 

$ 105.00 80 

$ 1.021.19 6 

$ 279.00 15 

$ 160.92 20 

$ 102.50 3 

$ 125.00 8 

$ 72.50 3 

$ 135.00 12 

Ext Price 

$ 5 280.00 

$ 1 350.00 

$ 1 575.00 

$ 2 600.00 

$ 1 776.25 

$ 4 852.48 

$ 8 400.00 

$ 6 127.14 

$ 4 185.00 

$ 3 218.40 

$ 307.50 

$ 1 000.00 

$ 217.50 

$ 1 620.00 
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Tartan 2.5gal EA $1 ,188.30 10 $ 11,883.00 

TM 4.5 Select ffhiophanate Methyl) 2.5gal EA $ 154.73 28 $ 4,332.44 

TOTAL: $ 58,724.71 



EXHIBI T "B" 
~ I 1,-

"ADVANCED 
TURF SOLUTIONS 

12840 Ford Drive• Fishers, IN 46038 
Phone: 3'17.842.1088 • FAX: 317.842.1847 
Toll Free: 877.433.7037 
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EXHIBIT "C" 

2012 Yankee Trace Golf Club Chemical Bid 

.,, ~ hf ru ":· !--;~.,,. .. I ,,. 

Name i 
Acelepryn I 

I 

Aqua Smart F I 
Aquasmart GT I 
Armor Tech 44 (Fairphite 1-0-26) I 
Quali Pro Chlorothalonil DF (18 cases) \ 

Quali Pro Chlorothalonil 720 (32 case~ 

Chipco 26019 Iprodione (40 Cases) ] 

Quali Pro Mefanoxam (3 cases) I 
Primo (15 gal) 

Quali Pro Propicanazol 14.3 ( 10 casesi 

Proxy (3 jugs) 

Quick Silver ( 8 containers) 

Round Up ( Alt - Razor Pro) (1 case) 

Signature (3 cases) 

Tartan ( 5 cases) 

Quali Pro TM 4.5 (14 cases) 

Total 

The Hill Company 

Mr. Jim Dillard 

I 
I 
I 

I 
I 
I 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

I 
I 

I 

I 

i 
I 
! I 

Size ' cost I I ' 
64oz I$ 000.00 I $ 

0 I No Bid ' I 

0 No Bid 

2 x2.5 gal $ 120.00 , $ 

2x10lb I$ 80.00 I $ 
2 x 2.5gal I$ 142.00 I $ 
2x2.5gal I $ 240.00 I $ 
2x2.5gal I $ 1,886.00 I $ 

15gal I $ 4,13s.oo $ 

2x2.5gal $ 420.00 I $ 
2x2.5gal $ 222.00 $ 

8oz $ 132.00 I $ 
2x25.fgal $ so.oo I $ 
4x5.51b $ 532.10 I $ 

2x2.5gal $ 2,376.60 I $ 
2x2.5gal $ 353.00 I $ 

l $ 

I I 
I I 
I 
I 
I 

I 
i I 
I I 
I I 

I I I 

I I 

I I 

2TT6 Circleport Drive 

Erlanger. KY 41018 

Jim Dillard 614-562-0600 

Total 

5,280.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

2,400.00 

1,400.00 

4,544.00 

9,600.00 

5,658.00 

4,135.00 

4,200.00 

333.00 

1,056.00 

80.00 

1,596.30 

11,883.00 

4,942.00 

57,107.30 

Ph: 614-562-0600 

Fax: 859-815-8322 



EXHIBIT "D" 

Helena Chemical Company(Adam Dillon) - To: Terry Taylor Yankee Trace Golf 
Product Total QTY needed Price/Unit Total Price 
Chemicals 

AceleDrvn 384oz $880J.5gal $5,280.00 

Aqua Smart F 30 gal NB NB 
Aqua Smart GT - (Soaker Plus-alt) 35 gal $28.00/gal $980.00 

Armor Tech 44(Elemax 6-40-16(alt)) 100 aal $33.00/gal $3,300 

Chlorothalonil DG 3501b $4.80/lb 1,680 

Chlorothalonil F 160gal 25.80/gal $4,128 

lprodione 200gal 40.90/gal $8,180 

Mefenoxam 15gal $335.50/gal $5,032.50 
Primo - (Podium-alt) 15gal $157.50/gal $2,362.50 

Propiconazole 50aal $73.10/gal $3,655.00 

Proxy-(Ethenhon-alt.) 7.Sgal $24.00gal $180 

Quicksilver 64oz $117/bot $936.00 

Round-Un-(Honcho Plus-alt) Sgal $11.50/gal $57.50 
Signature-(Fosetvl Aluminum-alt) 661b $15.50/lb $1,023 

Tartan 25gal 1188.30/2.Sgal $11,883.00 

Thiophanate Methyl 70gal $55.10/gal $3,875.00 

Total $52,552.50 
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EXHIBIT "E" 
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YANKEE TRACE GOLF COURSE CHEMICAL BID 2012 
CHEMICAL BID PRODUCTS 

2/7/2012 

... .. ·= ... -----. __ .., . UNIT PRICE TO . .. 
ACELPRYN 

AQUIFER (AQUA SMART F) 

AQUA AID (AQUA SMART GT) 

FUNGI PHITE (ARMOR TECH 44) 

CLOROTHALONIL 720 
CLOROTHALONIL 82.5 

IPRODIONE 

MEFENOXAM 

PRIMO 

PRIMO 

TRINEXAPAC ( alt for Primo) 

PROPICONAZOLE 

PROXY 

ETHEPHON 2 <alt for Proxy) 

QUICK SILVER 

RANGER PRO (alt Round Up) 

SIGNATURE 
FOSETYLvAL (alt for Sianature) 

TARTAN 

THIOPHANATE 

Craig Fryman 
93 7-603-8414 

6402 EACH 
2 x2.5 aallon 
2 x2.5 aallon 
2 X 2.5 aallon 
2 X 2.5 aallon 
4x5 lb 

2 X 2.5 oallon 
2 x2.5 aallon 

10 qal LP oallon 
2X1 aallon 

2 X 2.5 aallon 
2 x2.5 aallon 
2 x2.5 aallon 
2 X 2.5 aallon 

8 oz oz 
2 x2.5 aallon 

4 X 5.5 lb lb 
4 X 5.5 lb lb 

2 X 2.5 aallon 
2 X 2.5 aallon 

6 $880.00 $5,280.00 
30 $42.15 $1,264.50 
35 $20.50 $717.50 
100 $24.95 $2,495.00 
160 $27.65 $4,424.00 
350 $4.78 $1,673.00 

200 $49.85 $9,970.00 
15 $342.00 $5,130.00 
10 $270.00 $2,700.00 
5 $275.00 $1,375.00 

15 $185.00 $0.00 
50 $83.60 $4,180.00 
7.5 $45.75 $343.13 
7.5 $29.95 $0.00 
64 $17.25 $1,104.00 
5.0 $12.25 $61.25 

66.0 $31.50 $2,079.00 
66.0 $15.65 $0.00 
25 $475.32 $11,883.00 
70 $67.25 $4,707.50 

$59,386.88 
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