

RESOLUTION NO. 03-11
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, OHIO

SPONSORED BY COUNCILMEMBER Brooks Compton ON THE 24th
DAY OF January, 2011.

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BIDS SUBMITTED BY TURFGRASS INC., JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES, GREEN VELVET SOD FARMS, ADVANCED TURF SOLUTIONS,, AND CENTURY EQUIPMENT FOR CHEMICALS FOR THE GOLF CLUB AT YANKEE TRACE AND TO AUTHORIZE THE CITY MANAGER TO ENTER INTO CONTRACTS IN CONNECTION HEREWITH.

WHEREAS, the City of Centerville advertised for bidders for chemicals for The Golf Club at Yankee Trace according to specifications prepared by the City, and

WHEREAS, Turfgrass Inc., John Deere Landscapes, Green Velvet Sod Farms, Advanced Turf Solutions, and Century Equipment were the lowest and best bidders.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE HEREBY RESOLVES:

Section 1. That the following bids totaling \$64,658.86 are hereby accepted for chemicals for the Golf Club at Yankee Trace, marked as Exhibit "A," "B," "C," "D," and "E," attached hereto and made a part hereof:

- A. **Turfgrass Inc., \$14,924.00** including \$944.00 for 64 oz. of Quicksilver and \$13,980.00 for 30 gallons of Tartan.
- B. **John Deere Landscapes, \$15,247.98** including \$9,240.00 for the purchase of 220 gallons of Iprodione, \$337.50 for 7.5 gallons of Proxy, \$1,470.48 for 66 pounds of Signature, and \$4,200.00 for 70 gallons of Thiophanate-Methyl.
- C. **Green Velvet Sod Farms, \$12,874.13** including \$5,280.00 for the purchase of 384 ounces of Acelpryn, \$2,060.00 for 400 pounds of Clorothalonil DF, \$1,422.00 for 2.5 gallons of Imprelis, \$4,075.00 for 15 gallons of Primo, and \$37.13 for 2.5 gallons of RangerPro (alt).
- D. **Advanced Turf Solutions, \$18,646.75** including \$5,000.00 for the purchase of 100 gallons of Armor Tech 44, \$4,456.25 for 155 gallons of Clororthalonil F, \$5,235.00 for 15 gallons of Mefenoxam, and \$3,955.50 for 45 gallons of Propiconazole.
- E. **Century Equipment, \$2,966.00** including \$989.00 for 30 gallons of Aqua Smart F and \$1,977.00 for 35 gallons of Aqua Smart G T.

Section 2. The City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter into any necessary contracts to evidence acceptance of said bids and to make payment pursuant thereto.

Section 3. This resolution becomes effective at the earliest date allowed by law.

PASSED this 24th day of January, 2011.

C. Mark Kregel
Mayor of the City of Centerville, Ohio

ATTEST:

Julia M. Weaver
Assistant Clerk of Council, City of Centerville, Ohio

CERTIFICATE

The undersigned, Clerk of the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio hereby certifies that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution Number 03-11 passed by the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio on the 24th day of January, 2011.

Julia M. Weaver
Assistant Clerk of Council

Approved as to form, consistency with existing ordinances, the Charter and Constitutional Provisions.

Department of Law
Scott A. Liberman
Municipal Attorney

Client: CITY OF CENTERVILLE

TURFGRASS BID SHEET

Contact: TERRY TAYLOR'S 2011 CHEM BID LIST

DOUG SMITH 1/13/2011 10:00:00 AM

ITEM # PRODUCT DISCRPTION

QTY UNIT PRICE QTY EXTEND

ITEM #	PRODUCT DISCRPTION	QTY	UNIT	PRICE	QTY	EXTEND
1	ACELEPRYN 4X.5GAL/CS	400 OZ	EA	\$880.00	6.00	\$5,280.00
2	AQUA SMART F	30 GAL				
2A	QUICKWATER TG 2X2.5GAL/CS		CS	225.00	6	\$1,350.00
3	AQUA SMART GT	35 GAL				
3A	TRICURE AD 2X2.5GAL/CS		CS	325.00	7	\$2,275.00
4	ARMOR TECH 44	100 GAL				
4A	STRESS PHITER PLUS 2-0-30 30%Phosphite 2X2.5GL/CS		CS	\$144.99	20	\$2,899.80
5	CLOROTHONIL DF	400 LB				
5A	DOCKET DF 4X5LB/CS		CS	\$107.00	20.00	\$2,140.00
6	CLOROTHONIL F	155 GAL				
6A	DOCKET WS 2X2.5GL/CS		CS	\$171.19	31.00	\$5,306.89
7	IMPRELIS 2.5 GAL	2.5 GAL	EA	\$1,422.00	1.00	\$1,422.00
8	IPRODIONE	220 GAL				
8A	CHIPCO 26019 FLOWABLE 2X2.5GAL/CS		CS	\$260.00	44.00	\$11,440.00
9	MEFENOXAM 2 AQ 2X1GAL/CS	15 GAL	CS	\$850.00	7.50	\$6,375.00
10	PRIMO MAXX *AGENCY* 2X1GL/CS	15 GAL	CS	\$550.00	7.50	\$4,125.00
10A	T NEX 1AQ 2X2.5GAL/CS		CS	\$1,188.40	3.00	\$3,565.20
11	PROPICONAZOLE	45 GAL				
11A	DORADO 2X2GL/CS		CS	\$390.00	22.50	\$8,775.00
12	PROXY 2X2.5 GAL CS	7.5 GAL	CS	230.00	1.5	\$345.00
12A	ETHEPHON 2 SL 2X2.5GAL/CS		CS	\$160.00	2.50	\$400.00
13	QUICKSILVER T&O 4x8oz/CS	64 OZ	EA	\$118.00	8.00	\$944.00
14	ROUND UP	2.5 GAL				
14A	RAZOR PRO 2X2.5GAL/CS		CS	\$85.00	0.50	\$42.50
15	SIGNATURE CHIPCO WG80 4X5.5LB/CASE	66 LBS	CS	670.00	3	\$2,010.00
15A	FOSETYL-AI 80 WDG 4X5.5LB/CASE		CS	\$425.00	3.00	\$1,275.00
16	TARTAN *AGENCY* 2X2.5GAL/CS	30 GAL	CS	\$2,330.00	6.00	\$13,980.00
	THIOPHANATE-METHYL	70 GAL				
17	TM 4.5 (SELECT) 2X2.5GL/CS		CS	\$395.00	14.00	\$5,530.00

DOUG SMITH

513-292-0925

Exhibit A

1/13/2011

TERRY'S 2011 CHEM BID LIST

	JD Golf Item #	JD Golf Substitutions			Bid Price	Bid Size	Total
ACELPYRN	091505		400	Oz	\$ 13.75	Oz	\$ 5,500.00
AQUA SMART F			30	Gal			
	069333	Lesco Wet Plus	30	Gal	\$ 21.25	Gal	\$ 637.50
AQUA SMART GT			35	Gal			
	084570	LescoFlo Ultra	35	Gal	\$ 37.00	Gal	\$ 1,295.00
ARMOR TECH 44			300	Gal			
	082985	GreenFlo Phyte	300	Gal	\$ 23.25	Gal	\$ 6,975.00
	091463	Kphite	300	Gal	\$ 52.00	Gal	\$ 15,600.00
CLOROTHLONIL DF			400	Lb			
	084897	Manicure Ultra	400	Lb	\$ 5.45	Lb	\$ 2,180.00
	31215	Daconil Ultrex	400	Lb	\$ 7.75	Lb	\$ 3,100.00
CLOROTHLONIL F.			155	Gal			
	084901	Manicure 6Fl	155	Gal	\$ 29.65	Gal	\$ 4,595.75
	31217	Daconil Weatherstik	155	Gal	\$ 56.50	Gal	\$ 8,757.50
IMPRELIS	097588		2.5	Gal	\$ 568.80	Gal	\$ 1,422.00
IPRODIONE	0915360		220	Gal			
		18 Plus	220	Gal	\$ 42.00	Gal	\$ 9,240.00
MEFENOXAM	084921		15	Gal	\$ 380.00	Gal	\$ 5,700.00
	53195AGCY	Subdue Maxx	5	Gal	\$ 499.00	Gal	\$ 2,495.00
	53185	Subdue Maxx	1	LK	\$ 4,940.00	Gal	\$ 4,940.00
PRIMO	22534AGCY		5	Gal	\$ 275.00	Gal	\$ 1,375.00
	22535	PrimoMaxx	1	LK	\$ 2,700.00	LK	\$ 2,700.00
	090857	RegiMax	15	Gal	\$ 172.00	Gal	\$ 2,580.00
PROPICNAZOL			45	Gal			
	0914580	Spectator T&O	16	Gal	\$ 175.00	Gal	\$ 2,800.00
	0914520	Spectator Ultra	45	Gal	\$ 92.00	Gal	\$ 4,140.00
PROXY	069301		7.5	Gal	\$ 45.00	Gal	\$ 337.50
QUICK SILVER	069456		64	OZ	\$ 14.75	Oz	\$ 944.00
ROUND UP			2.5	Gal			
	069289	Prosecuto Pro	2.5	Gal	\$ 16.00	Gal	\$ 40.00
SIGNATURE	069098		66	Lbs	\$ 22.28	Gal	\$ 1,470.48
TARTAN	089236		30	Gal	\$ 466.00	Gal	\$ 13,980.00

Exhibit B

THIOPHANATE - METHYL			70	Gal			
	090809	T-Storm Flo	70	Gal	\$ 60.00	Gal	\$ 4,200.00

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
1385 EAST 36TH STREET
CLEVELAND, OH 44114

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: *Margaret Drozyna* **DATE:** 1/11/11

MARGARET DROZNAK
Sr. Bids REPRESENTATIVE



YANKEE TRACE GOLF COURSE CHEMICAL BID 2011
 CHEMICAL BID PRODUCTS

1/10/2011

	package	UOM	Quantity	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
ACELPRYN	64 OZ	EACH	6	\$880.00	\$5,280.00
FUNGI PHITE (ARMOR TECH 44)	2 x 2.5	gallon	100	\$25.29	\$2,529.00
CLOROTHALONIL 720	2 x 2.5	gallon	155	\$30.00	\$4,650.00
CLOROTHALONIL 82.5	4 x 5	lb	400	\$5.15	\$2,060.00
IMPRELIS	2.5 gal	2.5	1	\$1,422.00	\$1,422.00
IPRODIONE	2 x 2.5	gallon	220	\$53.85	\$11,847.00
MEFENOXAM	2 x 2.5	gallon	15	\$395.00	\$5,925.00
PRIMO	10 gal LP	gallon	10	\$270.00	\$2,700.00
PRIMO	2 X 1	gallon	5	\$275.00	\$1,375.00
TRINEXAPAC (alt for Primo)	2 x 2.5	gallon	15	\$190.00	\$0.00
PROPICONAZOLE	2 x 2.5	gallon	45	\$93.00	\$4,185.00
PROXY	2 x 2.5	gallon	7.5	\$46.00	\$345.00
ETHEPHON 2 (alt for Proxy)	2 x 2.5	gallon	7.5	\$36.00	\$0.00
QUICK SILVER	8 oz	oz	64	\$15.63	\$1,000.32
RANGER PRO (alt Round Up)	2 x 2.5	gallon	2.5	\$14.85	\$37.13
SIGNATURE	4 X 5.5 lb	lb	66.0	\$27.00	\$1,782.00
FOSETYL-AL (alt for Signature)	4 X 5.5 lb	lb	66.0	\$18.85	\$0.00
TARTAN	2 x 2.5	gallon	30	\$475.32	\$14,259.60
THIOPHANATE	2 x 2.5	gallon	70	\$80.00	\$5,600.00
					\$64,997.05

Craig Fryman
 937-603-8414

Exhibit C

ADVANCED TURF SOLUTIONS

12840 Ford Drive • Fishers, IN 46038
 Phone: 317.842.1088 • FAX: 317.842.1847
 Toll Free: 877.433.7037

Exhibit D QUOTATION

TO CITY OF CENTERVILLE
GOLF CLUB @ YANKEE TRACE

QUOTE DATE 1/13/11
 THIS QUOTATION IS VALID FOR 60 DAY
 TERMS NET 60

SHIP WEEK OF		DELIVERY VIA	FOB	
QUANTITY ORDERED	DESCRIPTION	UNIT SIZE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT
	ACELEPYRN	64oz	880.00	
	AQUASMART F		NO BID	
	AQUASMART GT		NO BID	
	ARMOR TECH 44	GAL	50.00	
	CHLOROTHALONIL DF	LB	5.60	
	CHLOROTHALONIL F	GAL	28.75	
	IMPRELIS	2.5 GAL	1422.00	
	IPRODIONE	GAL	50.10	
	MEFENOXAM	GAL	349.00	
	PCR 113 (PRIMO)	GAL	154.55	
	PROPICONAZOLE	GAL	87.90	
	ETHEPHEN (PROXY)	2.5 GAL	76.50	
	QUICKSILVER		NO BID	
	GLYSTAR PRO (RODDUP)	2.5 GAL	38.95	
	ARMOR TECH ALT 70 (SIGNATURE)	25.2 LB CS	357.50	
	TARTAN		NO BID	
	THIOPHANATE-METHYL	GAL	67.39	

MIKE JALSURY

AUTHORIZED BY

ACCEPTED BY

DATE

Exhibit E

Toledo Office Of:
 Century Equipment
 5959 Angola Road
 Toledo, OH 43615
 Phone: 419-865-7400
 Fax : 419-865-8215

Quotation# 115372
 Location# 200
 Date 01/12/11
 Page 1 OF 1

** Quotation **

214660
 GOLF CLUB at YANKEE TRACE
 CITY OF CENTERVILLE
 100 W SPRING VALLEY RD
 CENTERVILLE, OH 45458

Ship To:
 YANKEE TRACE GOLF COURSE
 10000 YANKEE STREET
 CENTERVILLE, OH 45458

Cust P/O: AQUA SMART BID Terms :Net 15 Days Reqs: 37 / 63
 Ship Via: SALESMEN Ord-Date: 01/11/11 Expires: 02/10/11 Written: BAS

Product/Description	Quantity	Price U/M	Extension
WSF-30G AQUASMA RT F FAIRWAY WETTING AGENT 30 GALLON DRUM	1	989.0000 EA	989.00
WSGT-2.5G AQUASMA RT GT PREMIUM TURF WETTING AGENT 2.5 GALLON	2	159.0000 EA	318.00
WSGT-30G AQUASMA RT GT PREMIUM TURF WETTING AGENT 30 GALLON DRUM	1	1659.0000 EA	1,659.00

THE GOLF CLUB AT YANKEE TRACE CHEMICAL BID FOR AQUA SMART PRODUCTS

SUBMITTED BY BETSY SMITH, DIRECTOR OF OPERATIONS,
 IRRIGATION DIVISION, TOLEDO, OH 419-724-1579.

JIM DILLARD, SALES MANAGER, 937-532-6780

JOHN AUSTIN, SERVICE TECH 937-623-6875

Merchandise	Handling	Misc. Charges	Sales Tax	Freight	Invoice Total
2,966.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	2,966.00

Accepted By _____ Date _____