RESOLUTION NO. /[o{-0%
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, OHIO

SPONSORED BY COUNCILMEMBER _500ks ("l ofern ON THE
231l DAY OF 77/%;\ cA. , 2009

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BIDS SUBMITTED
BY CENTURY EQUIPMENT, GREEN VELVET SOD
FARMS, LESCO, INC.-JOHN DEERE, AND
TURFGRASS, INC. FOR THE PURCHASE OF
CHEMICALS FOR THE GOLF CLUB AT YANKEE
TRACE AND TO AUTHORIZE THE CITY MANAGER
TO ENTER INTO CONTRACTS IN CONNECTION
HEREWITH.

WHEREAS, the City of Centerville advertised for bidders for the purchase of

chemicals for The Golf Club at Yankee Trace according to specifications prepared by
the City, and

WHEREAS, Century Equipment, Green Velvet Sod Farms, Lesco, Inc.-John

Deere, and Turfgrass, Inc., were the lowest and best bidders.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE HEREBY

RESOLVES:

Section 1. That the following bids be and are hereby accepted for chemicals for

the Golf Club at Yankee Trace, marked as Exhibit “A,” “B,” “C” and “D” attached
hereto and made a part hereof:

Century Equipment, $2,807.00 for the purchase of 30 gallons of Aquasmart F
for $989.00 and 32.5 gallons of Aquasmart G.T. for $1,818.00.

Green Velvet Sod Farms, $33,456.64 including $6,650.00 for 175 gallons
Chiorothalonil F1., $16,208.64 for 36 gal. of Tartan, $7,640.00 for 20 gallons
Subdue substitution (mefenoxam) and $2,958.00 for 20 gallons Instrata.

Lesco, Inc.-John Deere, $19,338.00 including $2,400.00 for the purchase of 20
gallons Primo substitution ( Regimax PGR), $2,160.00 for 320 lbs. of
Chlorothalonil D.G. substitution (LESCO Manicure Ultra), $3,770.00 for 65
gallons Chipco substitution (LESCO 18 Plus), $448.00 for 32 oz. Quick Silver,
$405 for 20 gallons Trimmec Bentgrass substitution (LESCO Eliminate-D),
$4.875.00 for 15 gallons Trinity and $5,280.00 for 3 gallons Acelepryn.




Turfgrass, Inc. $8,579.00 including$384.00 for the purchase of 10 gallons of
Proxy, $5,040.00 for 45 gallons Propiconazole, $1980.00 for 90 Ibs. of
Signature, and $1175.00 for 10 gallons Confront.

Section 2. The City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter into
any necessary contracts to evidence acceptance of said bids and to make payment
pursuant thereto.

Sectton 3. This resolution becomes effective upon its adoption.

PASSED this _43"% day of 7‘7/7@&, , 2000.

C M8 s

Mayor of the City of Centeftille, Ohio

ATTEST:

T Db O Oafm&l/

Clerk of Council, City ofCenterville, Ohto

CERTIFICATE

The undersigned, Clerk of the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio hereby
certifies that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution Number /-0

passed by the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio on the d3r/ . day of
2 %Zmé , 2009,

Wetra. Q. Qumea
Clerk ofﬁﬁncil




Approved as to form, consistency with
existing ordinances, the Charter and
Constitutional Provisions.

Department of Law

Scott A. Liberman

Municipal Attorney




EXHIBIT "A"

Toledo Office Of: Quotation# 112782
Century Egquipment Location# 200

5959 Angola Road Date 02/18/09
Toledo, OE 43615 Page lor1

Phone: 419-B&5-7400
Fax : 41%-B65-B215

% Quotation LA

214660 Ship To:

GOLF CLUB at YANKEE TRACE YANKEE TRACE GOLF COURSE

CITY OF CENTERVILLE 10000 YANKEE STREET

100 W SPRING VALLEY RD CENTERVILLE, OH 45458

CENTERVILLE, OH 45458
Cust P/0:AQUA SMART BID Terms :Net 15 Days Reps:37 /
Ship Via:UPS GROUND Ord-Date:02/16/09 Expires:03/18/09 Written:JAA
Product /Description Quantity Price U/M Extension
WSF-30G a4 SB9.0000 EA 989.00
AQUASMART F FAIRWAY WETTING AGENT 30 GALLON DRUM
WSGT-2.5G 1 159.0000 EA 155.00
AQUASMART GT PREMIUM TURF WETTING AGENT 2.5 GALLON
WSGT-30G il 1659.0000 EA 1,655.00

AQUASMART GT PREMIUM TURF WETTING AGENT 30 GALLON DRUM

CITY AQUA SMART BID

Merchandise Handling Misc. Charges Sales Tax Freight Invoice Total
2,807.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 2,807.00
Date

Accepted By



’—l;rimo Max
| Trinexapac-Ethyl
Proxy
Chiorothalonil 720
Chlorothalonit DF
Daconil Weatherstik
aconil Ultrex
[ Propiconazole
anner max
Tartan
Signature
EChipco 26 GT
prodione E-Pro
Trinity
ubdue Maxx
{ Mefenoxam
Quick Silver
Instrata
Trimec Bent
Confront
Myst Wet Agent
Immerse wet Agent

10 gal link pak
2x2.5

2x2.5

2x2.5

4x5 b

2.2.5

4x5 or 4x10 Ib
2x2.5

10 gal link pak
2x2.5

4x5.5 Ib casC
2x2.5

2x2.5

2x2.5

10 gal link pak
2x2.5

8 oz btl

2x2.5

2x2.5

4x1

2x2.5

2x2.5

EXHIBIT

$305.25 gal
$263.00 gal
$40.00 gal
$38.00 gal
$6.87 Ib
$65.28 gal
$9.23 Ib
$139.50 gal
$275.00 gal
$450.24 gal
$565.00/cs
$130.00 gal
$65.00 gal
$325.00 gal
$451.05 gal
$382.00 gal
$134.00 bti
$147.90 gal
$32.80 gal
$140.00 gal
$39.00 gal
$19.00 gal

All Syngenta products must be ordered by 2-28-09 and have 7-05-09 terms



Product How
Bid Item Number Quantity | Units Description Product Bidding Unit Price [Extended Price] Blddin Notes
1 10 gallons |P:Imo 10 galidrum 222535 $305.25/gal|] $3,502.50 |As Specified [Agency Price
1A 10 |galions LESCO Regimax PGR 2x2.Sgal/cs #080863 $240.00/gal ] $2,400.00 _ jAltenate
2 10 gallons IP:oxy 2x2.5galics #069303 $47.00/gal $470.00 As Specified
3 175 allons [Chiorothalonil FL LESCO Manicure 8FI 2x2.5galics #084905 $40.40/gal $7,070.00  |Subslitute
4 320 pounds {Chiorothalonil DG {LESCO Manicure Ultra 82.5% 4x5Ib-jug/cs #084899  |$6.75/1b $2,160.00  [Subslitule
5 45 gallons |Propiconazole LESCO Speciator Ultra 1.3 2x2.5galics #084938 $140.00/gal |  $6.300.00 | Subslilule
8 35 gallons |Taitan 2x2.5galics #089242 $450.24/gal]  $15,758.40 JAs Specified |Agency Price
7 90 pounds | Signature 4x5.5lbics #0B2182 $27.50Mb $247500 |As Specified
7A 20 pounds |LESCO Prodigy Signature 800G 4x5.5Ib/cs #069089  |$25.50/b $2,205.00  |Alternale
] 65 gallons |Chipco 26 GT 2x2.5gal/cs #053940 $150.00/gal| $9,75000 [As Specified
BA 65 gallons LESCO 18 Plus 2 5gal #091088 $58.00/gal $3,770.00 _ |Alternale o
g 15 galtons | Trinity 2x2.5gacs #030789 $325 D0/gal | $4,875.00 _|As Specilied JAgency Price
10 20 gallons |Subdue i'ﬁgal!drum #53185 $499 00/gal| $9,980.00 |As Specified |Agency Price
10A 20 gallons Mefenoxam 2 AQ 2x2 5gal/cs #084929 440.00/gal | $8,800.00 _ {Alternale
1 32 ounces |Quicksilver 4xBozics #0B9483 $14 00/oz $448.00  |As Specified
12 20 gallons |Instrata 2.5 gallon #26327 $147.90/gal | $2,95B.00 |As Specified |Agency Price
13 20 gallons {Trimec Benlgrass No Bid
13A 20 lions LESCO Eliminate-D 2x2.5gal/cs #088485 $20.25/gal $405.00 Subslitute
14 10 'gallans Conlront 4x1gal/cs #019375 $130.00/gal| $1.300.00 _ |As Specified
15 30 gallons {Water Smart No Bid
154 30 galions LESCOFio Ultra Wetling Agent 2x2.5gal/cs #084580 | $42.00/gal $1,260 00 |Substitule
16 a0 gallons |Water Smart GT No Bid
16A 30 gallons |LESCO Wet Plus 2x2.5qalics #089384 $25.00/gal $750.00 Substitute
17 3 gallons |Acelepiyn |84 ounce #091505 (3 gal=6 jugs=384 oz} 13.75/0z $5,280.00  |As Specified
18 30 gallons |LESCO Sevin SL 2x2.5galics #082014 40.00/gal $1,200.00 _ |Afternale  |Not specifically requested on bid
19 2 gallons |Allectus GC SC iqal #088818 $257 .00/ $514 00 |Allernale Not specifically requested on bid
Terms: Net 30
Delivery: 7-10 Days AROD P
FOB: Destination
Prices Firm: Thiough 12/31/09
Contact: Bid Depattment-LESCO, Inc
1301 E 2th St, Ste 1300
Cleveland, Ot 44114
Phone: 1-800-321-5325, ext. 6550
Fax: 248-581-1433
Email_bids@jobndeerefandscapes com

udn LIGTHX3



EXHIBIT "D"

City of Centerville, OH
The Golf Club @ Yankee Trace
Chemical Bid u{fém{(
2'1 7'2009 hr!nlt‘-uv;’uﬂ"w-’ﬁlntr‘g‘?:

ltem Oty Unit Cost Total Cost  Terms
Primo Maxx 10 gal $305.25/gal  § 3,052.50 7-5-09
Proxy 10 gal $ 38.40/gal $ 384.00 Net30days
Chlorothalonil (Mainsail 6F) 175 gal $ 44.00/gal § 7,700.00 Net 30 days
Chlorothalonil (Mainsail WDG) 3201bs.  $ 7.05/1b. § 2.256.00 Net 30 days
Propiconizole (Fathom) 45 gal $112.00/gal § 5,040.00 Net 30 days
Tartan 36 gal $450.24/gal $16,208.64 Net 30 days
Chipco Signature 90 Ibs. $ 22.00ib. § 1980.00 Net 30 days
Chipco 26GT 65 gal $108.65/gal $ 7,062.25 Net 30 days
Chipco 26019 Flogpredione) 65 gal $ 68.00/gal § 4,420.00 Net 30 days
Trinity 12 gal $325.00/gal  § 3,900.00 Net 30 days
Subdue Maxx Link Pak 20 gal $451.05/gal  § 9,021.00 7-5-09
Quicksilver 8 oz. 4 ea $125.00/ea $ 500.00 Net 30 days
Instrata 20 gal $147.90/gal § 2,958.00 7-5-09
Trimec Bentgrass 20 gal $ 30.00/gal $ 600.00 Net30days
Confront 10 gal $117.50/gal $ 1,175.00 Net 30 days
WaterSmart F No Bid
WaterSmart GT No Bid
Substituien:
TG Quickwater(Monthly) 30 gal $ 55.00/gal $ 1.650.00 Net 30 days
Acelepryn 3 gal (6ea) $880.00/'2 gal $ 5.520.00 Net 30 days

Total $73,187.39

Note: Syngetna items in Bold prices are good through 2-28-09 with terms of 7-5-09.

Bid opening on 2-19-09 qualifies above Syngenta prices through 9-30-09

IRTGLEA

46495 Humboldt Drive, Novi. M1 48317 248.4370427 248.4375610 FAX

650 Expressway Court Gaylord, M1 49735 989-705-B180 oBg-jo5-Bno FAX

n2 Little Bussen Drve, PD.Box13n Fenton, MO 63026 636-305no0  636-3057535 FAX
gy Electric Ave, Sulte 8. Wayland. MI 49348 616-877-3742 616877 0464 FAX

5753 W Bsth Street Indianapelis.iN 46278 :17-4n-8309 3174718326 FAX

85 FishelWay Marshfield, MO 65706 417-850-0502  417-B50-0583 FAX

Bags D Dixie Hignway, PO, Box 637 Florence, KY 21027-0637 B59-504-4948 B59-504-2048 FAX
N30 industria’ Parkway Morth Sulte 0, Brunswick, OH 41211 330-225-2084 330225 2002 FAX



