
RESOLUTION NO. lf C/-Q{p 
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, omo 

PONSORED BY COUNCILMEMBER -~ ~ C~'G ON THE /(g-tL DAY 
F Oc-1-u-&ti -c::: • 2006. 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BID SUBMITTED BY 
TURFGRASS SOUTH. LLC. AND GREEN VELVET SOD 
FARMS FOR THE PURCHASE OF FERTILIZER FOR THE 
GOLFCOURSEATYANKEETRACEANDTOAUTHORIZE 
THE CITY MANAGER TO ENTER INTO A CONTRACT IN 
CONNECTION THEREWITH. 

WHEREAS. the City of Centerville advertised for bidders for the purchase of 
ertilizer for The Golf Club at Yankee Trace according to specifications prepared by the 
ity. and 

WHEREAS. Green Velvet Sod Farms and Turfgrass South. LLC. were the low 
d best bidders. 

NOW. THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE HEREBY 
SOLVES: 

Section 1. That the following bids be and are hereby accepted for fertilizers for The 
olfClub at Yankee Trace, marked as Exhibit "A", attached hereto and made a part hereof: 

Green Velvet Sod Farms, $32,576.00, for the purchase of the following: 
Granular Fertilizers -Anderson 15-3-15 + Merit, FF II 14-3-3, 
and 18-9-18. 

Turfgrass South, LLC., $27,570.00, for the purchase of the following: 
Granular Fertilizers - Anderson 11-3-11 +Pendimethalin, 0-0-45 
Liquid Fertilizers - Griggs Brothers 18-3-4 +Iron, Ultra Plex 5-0-3. 
A-0-K 1-0-25, and PK Plus. 

The City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter into any necessary 
ontracts to evidence acceptance of said bids and to make payment pursuant thereto. 

PASSED this /~-ti day of Oc fo,bcJLc , 2006. 



Mayor of the City of Centerville, Ohio 

CERTIFICATE 

The undersigned, Clerk of the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio hereby 
ertifies that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution Number <fl-Oh 
assed by the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio on the / u -tL day of 

c -fi 2006. 

pproved as to form. consistency with 
xisting ordinances, the Charter and 
onstitutional Provisions. 

Department of Law 
Scott A. Liberman 
Municipal Attorney 



l • t J 

ITEM 

25-2-9 
11-3-11 + Pend. 
15-3-15 + Merit 
FF 1114-3-3 
21-3-20 
16-25-12 
18-9-18 
17-3-17 
0-0-45 

Liquid 

18-3-4 + Iron 
Ultra Plex 5-0-3 
A-0-K 1-0-25 
PK Plus 

THE GOLF CLUB AT YANKEE TRACE 
FERTILIZER BID RESULTS 

9-0ct-06 

Green Velvet 
Sod Farms 

$24.40 
$17.15 
$55.15 
$65.80 
$21.75 
$20.65 
$27.75 
$35.25 
$41.60 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

Advanced Turf 
Solutions 

$18.90 
$16.70 
$56.00 
$73.70 
$19.40 
$20.60 
$29.80 
$34.95 
$41.35 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

Turfgrass 
South 

$26.00 
$15.50 
$58.00 
$75.00 
$25.00 
$22.50 
$29.50 
$40.30 
$34.75 

$147.00 
$210.00 
$167.00 
$225.00 

EXHIBIT "A" 

Lesco 

$16.09 
$15.26 
$47.00 
$50.75 
$12.57 
$11.60 
$24.95 
$19.09 
$11.89 

$47.95 
$42.50 
$59.65 
$119.00 

Note: Items specified were Anderson's on granular products and Griggs Brothers on liquid. 
Lesco bid substitute products. Advanced Turf Solutions did not have a bid bond. 
Prices above are unit prices for each product. 


