RESOLUTION NO. 54 -06
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, OHIO

pPONS RED BY COUNCILMEMBER L Jscsg s Clims _ ONTHE 0P~ DAY
, 2006.

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BIDS SUBMITTED BY
GREEN VELVET SOD FARMS, LESCO, TURFGRASS
SOUTH, ALLEGHENY LAWN AND IKEX FOR THE
PURCHASE OF CHEMICALS FOR THE GOLF CLUB AT
YANKEE TRACE AND TO AUTHORIZE THE CITY
MANAGER TO ENTER INTO CONTRACTS IN
CONNECTION HEREWITH.

WHEREAS, the City of Centerville advertised for bidders for the purchase
bf chemicals for The Golf Club at Yankee Trace according to specifications prepared by
the City, and

WHEREAS, Green Velvet Sod Farms, Lesco, Turfgrass South, Allegheny
[ awn and IKEX were the low and best bidders.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE HEREBY
RESOLVES:

Section 1. That the following bids be and are hereby accepted for chemicals for
The Golf Club at Yankee Trace, marked as Exhibit “A” attached hereto and made a part
hereof
. Green Velvet Sod Farms for the purchase of the following:
Instrata for a total of $19,600.
. Lesco for the purchase of the following:
2,4 D MCPP and Emerald for a total of $1,815.50.
. Turfgrass South for the purchase of the following:
Daconil Ultrex, 26 GT, Primo Maxx, Teremac SP, Sevin SL, Allectus
SC for a total of $18, 904.00.
. Allegheny Lawn for the purchase of the following:
Headway and Heritage TL for a total of $9,752.00.
. IKEX for the purchase of the following:
Tartan for a total of $14,000.00.




The City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter into any necessary
contracts to evidence acceptance of said bids and to make payment pursuant thereto.

PASSED this_XO% _day of_?a% 2006.

Mayor of the City of Centerville, Ohio

ATTEST:

T8, 80 ¥R Ui 2

Clerk of Council, Cil{?lenterville, Ohio

CERTIFICATE

The undersigned, Clerk of the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio hereby
certifies that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution Number,
passed by the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio on the _ X0 _ day of
7/,);1;“1«.@{/&./ , 2006.

b (2, an_@d.)_

Clerk of %eﬂ

Approved as to form, consistency with
existing ordinances, the Charter and
Constitutional Provisions.

Department of Law

Scott A. Liberman

Municipal Attorney




THE GOLF CLUB AT YANKEE TRACE

Exhibit "a"

CHEMICAL BID
13-Nov-06
VENDOR GREEN LESCO TURFGRASS ALLEGHENY  IKEX
ITEM VELVET SOUTH LAWN

Daconil Ultrex $181 00 $142.00 $181.00 $181.00 | $181.00
Headway Link Pack | $4,300.00 No Bid $4,300.00 | $4,300.00 |$4,300.00
Heritage TL $1.152.00 No Bid $1.152.00 | $1.152.00 |$1,152.00
Tartan $2,000.00 | $2,000.00 | $2.000.00 | $2.000.00 |$2,000.00
instrata $700 00 No Bid $700.00 $700.00 | $700.00
26 GT $600 00 $465.00 $545.00 NoBid [ $600.00
2.4 D, MCPP $112 00 $98.50 $108.00 No Bid No Bid
Primo Maxx $3.500.00 No Bid $3.500.00 | $3.500.00 |33,500.00
Teremac SP $425 00 No Bid $365.00 No Bid No Bid
Sevin SL $170 00 $158.00 $137.00 No Bid | $161.48
Alieclus SC $858 00 | $1,792.60 $840.00 No Bid $920.00
Emerald $1,886 50 | $1,323.00 | $1.323.00 | $1.323.00 |$1,323.00




