RESOLUTION NO., _“\- o
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, OHIO

SPONSORED.BY COUNCILMEMBER. 22@%@9 O.Clhwe _ ONTHE /5%

DAY OF - opemalber / , 2004.

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BIDS SUBMITTED
BY GREEN VELVET SOD FARMS AND TURFGRASS
SOUTH FOR THE PURCHASE OF FERTILIZER FOR
THE GOLF CLUB AT YANKEE TRACE AND TO
AUTHORIZE THE CITY MANAGER TO ENTER INTO
CONTRACTS IN CONNECTION THEREWITH.

WHEREAS, the City of Centerville advertised for bidders for the purchase
of fertilizer for The Golf Club at Yankee Trace according to specifications prepared by
the City, and

WHEREAS, Green Velvet Sod Farms and Turfgrass South were the low
and best bidders.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE HEREBY
RESOLVES:

Section 1. That the following bids be and are hereby accepted for fertilizers for
The Golf Club at Yankee Trace, marked as Exhibit “A”, attached hereto and made a part
hereof:

. Green Velvet Sod Farms for the purchase of the following: Granular
Fertilizers - Anderson’s 11-3-11+ Pend., Anderson’s 15-3-15 + Merit,
Anderson’s 21-3-20 and FFII for the total amount of $19,802.00.

. Turfgrass South for the purchase of the following: Liquid Fertilizers -
Gary’s Green 18-3-4 + iron, Tuff Turf 1-0-14, Sila Cal B, Ultra-Plex 5-0-3,
A-O-K 1-0-25 for the total amount of $21,450.00.




The City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to enter into any necessary contracts
ko evidence acceptance of said bids and to make payment pursuant thereto.

PASSED this __ /5% day of 7/70,}%14&@./ , 2004

(2 Mol Jopoay)

Mayor of the City of Centerville, Ohio

ATTEST:
\Am';ﬁ—:\) \ Mfe e .Z,Q.CL__
LClerk of Council, City of Centerville, Ohio

CERTIFICATE

The undersigned, Clerk of the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio hereby
certifies that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution Number__¥/-0
passed by the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio on the __ /5% day of
orpmber , 2004

Clerk of Council 1

Approved as to form, consistency with
existing ordinances, the Charter and
Constitutional Provisions.

Department of Law

Scott A. Liberman

Municipal Attorney




GOLF CLUB AT YANKEE TRACE

PRODUCT

Anderson's 25-2-9

Amderson's 11-3-11 + Pend.
Anderson's 15-3-15 + Merit

FFIt

Anderson's 21-3-20

Griggs Brothers 16-4-8 Greens Spec

LIQUID FERTILIZERS
Grigg Brothers

Gary's Green 18-3-4+ iron
Tuff Turf 1-0-14

Sila Cal B

Ultra-Plex 5-0-3

A-O-K 1-0-25

FERTILIZER BID RESULTS
18-Oct-04
GREEN VELVET
QTY UNIT TOTAL

80 Bags $21.70 $1,736.00
80 Bags $13.70 $1,006.00
80 Bags $47.80 $4,302.00
210 Bags $62.00 $13,020.00
80 Bags $17.30 $1,384.00
40 Bags NO BID
100 Cases NO BID
6 Cases NO BID
10 Cases NOBID
10 Cases NO BID
8 Cases NO BID

EXHIBIT "a"

TURFGRASS SOUTH

UNIT

$23.70
$15.70
$53.50
$69.80
$20.70
$28.00

$145.00
$255.00
$200.00
$210.00
$165.00

TOTAL
$1,808.00
$1,256.00
$4,815.00

$14,658.00
$1,658.00
$1,120.00

$14,500.00
$1,530.00
$2,000.00
$2,100.00
$1,320.00

Note: Bids documents were received from Pro Source One ( No Bid on any item) and Advanced Turf Sclutions ( No Bid Bond).



