
RESOLUTION NO. lij - q 1 
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, omo 

SPONSORED BY COUNCILMEMBER 07lN£o --:St Ne,ce ONTHE 
(pt/z DAY OF (J(!.To£JE£. , 1997. 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BID FROM CARGILL 
SALT, INC., AND AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER 
TO ENTER INTO AN AGREEMENT WITH CARGILL 
SALT, INC., FOR THE PURCHASE OF IDGHW A Y ROCK 
SALT FOR SNOW AND ICE CONTROL FOR 1998 FOR 
THE CITY OF CENTERVILLE, omo. 

WHEREAS, the Southwest Ohio Purchasers for Government (SWOP4G) 
advertised for bidders for Highway Rock Salt pursuant to specifications prepared by 
SWOP4G; and 

WHEREAS, SWOP4G accepted bids from Central Salt Company, North American 
Salt Company, Cargill, Inc., Morton International, Inc., and American, Inc., for the 
purchase of highway rock salt; and . 

WHEREAS, Cargill Salt, Inc., is the low and best bidder for the City of 
Centerville, Ohio. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE HEREBY · 
RESOLVES: 

Section 1. . That the bid submitted by Cargill Salt, Inc., for the purchase of 
highway rock salt according to the specifications marked exhibit "A" attached hereto and 
made a part hereof, is hereby accepted for the purchase price of $30.99 per ton, plus 
$1.50 per ton piling charge. 

Section 2. That the City Manager is hereby authorized and directed to· enter into 
any necessary agreement to evidence acceptance of said bid and to make payment 
pursuant thereto. 

Section 3. This Resolution shall become effective at the earliest date allowed 
bylaw. 

PASSED this u+/2 day of {)(!.ftJJ:3 ER. 1997. 



ATTEST: 

CERTIFICATE 

The undersigned, Clerk of the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio, hereby 
certifies that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution Number q 3- 9 7 
passed by the Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio, on the /4 IA day 
of ()C:ror.5/G',e , 1997. 

Approved as to form, consistency 
with the Charter and Constitutional Provisions. 

Department of Law 
Robert N. Farquhar 
Municipal Attorney 

~Q~~__gc ~ 
Clerk of Coun7 ~ 



Exhibit "A" 

1997 Rock Salt Bid 

Highway Rock Salt - SWOP4G Bid #57 44-20 - Opened August 19, 1997 I ~- -
Central Salt North American Morton Cargill American 

Qty./Tons Price/Ton Price/Ton Price/Ton Price/Ton Price/Ton 
Bath Township 500.00 [IR ... ··· $ 33.45 $ 37.46 $ 33.29 $ 39.46 
Beavercreek City of 3,000.00 $ 30.99 · $ 33.45 $ 35.75 [~§~4!}J $ 37.75 
Bellbrook City ~f 700.00 ~-~-6l $ 33.45 $ 34.46 $ 32.89 $ 39.46 
!3ethel Township 1----, 500.00 ~11)11§,~\ $ 35.40 $ 37.21 $ 35.35 $ 39.21 
§~!ey City of 500.00 $ 40.55 $ 38.54 $ 36.55 ~~a@pJf!Q,! $ 36.94 
Blendon Township 600.00 $ 35.24 lii~~~~a, $ 38.45 $ 34.60 $ 36.04 
Brookville Cityof . 400.00 [~.~ $ 34.25 $ 37.25 $ 33.58 $ 39.25 
Butler Township 2,000.00 $ 33.62 $ 34.93 $ 36.12 ~ . $ · 38.12 
Canal Winchester 400.00 $ 39.50 $ 37.62 $ 38.32 ~·~ffll-:~ . 36.73 _. 
Centerville City of 2,100.00 $ 31.22 $ 31.25 $ 35.25 $ 37.25 3 "2., t.f 9 
CentralOhioTransitAuthority 400.00 $ 37.42 $ 42.76 $ 50.00 '

1
. ~ $ 36.12 u.:l;f<... fl~ 

Clark County Engineers 2,000.00 $ 33.67 $ 34.37 $ 38.17 : ,; ~~ $ 38.17 
Clermont Co_unty Engineers 5,000.00 $ 31.63 No Bid $ 29.50 .. .a, .... ~ $ -~~.63 ~l°t't<a 
Columbu: Airport Authority 300.00 $ 40.37 $ 41.66 $ 37.00 $ 38.60 ~~i2!?J..Z§l "3_\ ns · l 
Dayton City of 8,000.00 $ 32.90 $ 31.00 $ 35.45 ■·, . . ·lf.:j $ 37.40 ~ 11\... r' <t,(... 

Dayton Bd of Education 150.00 $ 33.25 $ 32.75 $ 36.75 ffl \1f~ $ 37.75 

Delaware City of ,--- 1,009_:QQ . No Bid-= $ 3~.7~ _$ 41.09_ m· ~,1111 -~----~~:??. 
Englewood City of 500.00 1.,~'.tfl~lft~l $ 32.25 $ 36.50 $ 32.24 $ 38.50 
Fairborn City of 2,000.00 $ 31.47 $ 33.00 $ 35.50 .~ tz ·; $ 37.50 
Farmersville Village of 100.00 $ 32.27 $ 32.27 $ 37.00 , ·. $ 39.77 
Franklin County Engineer 12,000.00 No Bid No Bid $ 39.92 ,. · · · $ 34.92 
Franklin Township (Warren Cty) 1,300.00 $ 29.88. $ 30.45 $ 31.40 ~ .' 9 $ 36.49 
Germantownship Road Dept 350.00 ■·. . . d~ $ 31.45 $ 35.46 $ 31.35 $ · 37.46 

~~;;;~~;;r1:;~;:~--°-~P~ .......... ___ ,_;~~:~~. . . . -~:,i . ·::i1f!l -t ... -'--·····-·-·· ~;:~! .. _: ___ ~;;~~-- : ~~:~: i !~:~! 
Greene_CounJy ,!-lighwa}'. Dept 5,000:2-~- _$ . ~1-~.,2 $ 31.30 $ 35.75 lffi~~-• -~----- ... 3?.75. 
1-:!~~£!~.~!!.l~~~ship Mont. Cly. --~.!500.00 ~~m-~Nli$.!Pl'.~Jt\§~ __ $ 32.6~_ $ 36.15 _ ~; i~5~ $ 3~=~-~ 
HuberHglsCityof _I 4,000.00_J; 3~.Z~. $ 31.75 $ 35.7_§_ 

1
0 i~ $ 37.75 

Indian Hill Village of 2,000.00 $ 30.20 $ 31.00 $ 30.00 8 $ 40.00 
Jackson Township Road Dept 150.00 · $ 32.87 $ 33.37 $ 35.37 ,8 $ 37.37 
Jefferson Township Road Dept 600.00 fJIHll"§.f@ffl $ 35.04 $ 37.46 $ 33.19 $ 39.46 
Kettering City of 3,500.00 $ 30.99 $ 31.30 $ 35.75 IJl!<aPfli5.~ $ 37_75· 
Lebanon City of 800.00 -~\\\!;;!5lll $ 32.25 $ 36.25 $ 31.69 $ 38.25 
Liberty Township 500.00 No Bid $ 35.73 $ 42.74 l,$J..•83t6Q;~ $ 39.74 

97salt Page 1 8/21/97 



1997 Rock Salt Bid 

Central Salt North American Morton American 
Mad River Towns hip Clark Cty 400.00 $ 33.41 $ 33.90 $ 36.91 37.91 
Mason City of 2,500.00 $ 30.2 ·, O· $ 29.59 37.70 
Miami County Engineer 3,500.00 $ 34.14 $ 38.15 40.15 
Miami Townshi Clermont Cty 1,000.00 32.84 $ 31.74 38.74 
Miami Townshi Mont Cty 4,000.00 31.41 $ 35.25 · 37.25 
Miami Valley RTA 100.00 32.44 $ 36.44 38.44 
Miamisburg Cit of 1,700.00 31.41 $ 35.25 37.25 
Middletown City of 1,5Q0.qQ_ 32.25 $ 36.26 38.26 
~ilford City of 500.00 34.61 $ 32.62 $ 38.62 
Monroe City of 700.00 32.25 $ 36.26 $ 38.26 
Montgomery Cty Engineers 13,000.00 $ 31.65 $ 35.68 $ -37.68 
Moorefield Townshi Clark Ct 500.00 $ 33.4 33.93 $ 37.95 $ 37.95 
Moraine City of 2,200.00 $ 32.7 31.24 $ 35.25 $ 37.25 
New Albany Village of 1,000.00 $ 36.4 33.94 $ 40.00 $ 36.18 
New Carlisle City of 300.00 $ 35.1 a: $ 37.64 $ 39.64 
Oakwood City of 1,000.00 $ 31.64 $ 32.30 $ 36.15 38.15 
Pataskala Village of 1,000.00 $ 40.48 $ 40.74 $ 40.00 37.98 
Piqua City of 1,500.00 $ 35.33 $ 33.73 $ 37.83 39.83 
Plain Township Trustees 300.00 $ 37.15 $ 37.06 $ 41.66 ,,,§W§fil J.,a~ .. ;.i. 
Powell Village of··- 400.00 No Bid $ 38.27 $ 40.00 ·36.27 
Randolph Towns hip 800.00 $ 33.45 $ 37.46 39.46 
Reynoldsburg City of 2,000.00 $ 34.00 $ 46.40 36.32 
Riverside City of 3,500.00 $ 32.14 $ 36.15 38.15 
Sidney City of 1,800.00 $ 36.65 $ 40.66 42.66 
Springboro City of 1,500.00 $ 31.26 $ 34.66 36.66 
Springfield City of 4,000.00 $ 33.89 $ 37.29 38.29 
Springfield Towns hip 800.00 $ 34.79 $ 39.20 $ 34.88 $ 38.20 
Trenton City of 200.00 $ 32.46 $ 36.26 $ 31.68 $ 38.26 
TrO.!Y.-'OC:,~ f!!Y. .<?.~ -·--· ..... _2,000.00. $ 32.49 $ 36.50 $ $ 38.50 
Troy City of 1,100.00 mnfi~~illR· $ 38.15 $- ··-- ., ___ $, -

40.15 
~r.eer Arlington Cit of 2,000.0Q_ $ 38.92 $ 37.45 $ 39.92 , $ 36.32 -
Urbana City of 600.00 $ 35.40 $ 33.89 $ 38.90 $ 39.90 
Vandalia City of 2,500~Q_ $ 31.23 $ 32.04 $ 35.84 $ 37.84 -
Versailles Village of 200.00 35.10 $ 37.07 $ 39.86 $ 41.86 
Washington Twp Mont Cty 2,600.00 $ 33.24 $ 37.44 $ 39.44 
West Carrollton City of 1,200.00 32.75 $ 33.24 $ 35.25. ' $ 37.25 
West Milton Villaqe of 400.00 $ 34.75 - $ 37.25 $ 39.25 . . ~~-
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1997 Rock Salt Bid 

I Central Salt North American Morton Cargill American 
Xenia Village of 1,500.00 $ 31.44 $ 31.69 $ 35.75 ~51 $ 37.75 

I 
Piling Charge Per Ton, All locations. $ 1.50 $ 2.00 $ 1.50 $ 1.50 $ 1.50 

I 
Note: Piler Minimum Tonnage 200T 200T 200T 200T 
Note: Dump MinimumTonnage 24T 22T 
Note: Performance Bond/$1 M No CharQe No Chan:ie No CharQe $ 17.50 
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