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RESOLUTION NO . ~, -qi 
CITY OF CENTERVILLE, OHIO 

SPONSORED BY COUNCILMEMBER C . rf\--c.,.r\.f \~u,.. 3 &t t.d ON THE 
7.. ,;.~ DAY OF ---=-F""'-~'i;..-;:· \.o=V>'-"V"'-~-\r__.7......,....:;;..;=t,.--==-------, 19 9 4 • 

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING PARTS OF BIDS SUBMITTED 
BY CENTURY EQUIPMENT AND XENIA POWER EQUIPMENT 
AND BY CONTRACT WITH THE STATE OF OHIO, 
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES, OFFICE 
OF STATE PURCHASING FOR THE PURCHASE OF 
EQUIPMENT FOR YANI<EE TRACE GOLF COURSE AND TO 
AUTHORIZE THE CITY MANAGER TO ENTER INTO 
CONTRACTS IN CONNECTION THEREWITH. 

WHEREAS, the City advertised for bidders for equipment 
for Yankee Trace Golf Course in the city of Centerville, pursuant 
to specifications prepared by the City; and 

WHEREAS, Century Equipment and Xenia Power Equipment 
were the lowest and best bidders for equipment as specified, and 

WHEREAS, the City of Centerville by Ordinance Number 
19-88 is authorized to participate in contracts of the State of 

1Ohio, Department of Administrative Services, Office of State 
Purchasing for the purchase of supplies, services, equipment and 
certain materials. 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE MUNICIPALITY OF CENTERVILLE HEREBY 
RESOLVES: 

SECTION 1. That part of the bid submitted by Century 
Equipment, marked Exhibit "A", attached hereto and made a part 
hereof, is hereby accepted for the following equipment: 

6 Walk Behind Greens Mowers $ 31,668.00 
3 Triplex Greens Mowers 47,832 . 00 
2 Golf Course Sprayers 45,450.00 
3 Fiveplex Fairway Mowers 74,286 . 00 
1 Heavy Duty Work Vehicle 12,400.00 
1 Heavy Duty Work Vehicle 19,300.00 
1 Riding Bunker Rake 10,861. 00 
2 Thatcher Seeders 9,466.00 
2 Greens Aerators 19,990.00 
1 Water Injecting Aerator 22,748.00 
1 Tow Behind Fairway Aerator 23,135.00 
1 P.T.O. Driven Blower 3,224 . 00 
1 Turf sweeper 10,845.00 
2 core Destroyers 5,734 . 00 
2 Compact Utility Triplexes 26,578.00 
2 Hand Push Rotary Mowers 1,490.00 
1 Reel Spin Grinder 11,995.00 



. . 

1 Bedknife Grinder 8,495.00 
,for a total cost of $344,946.51 after discount of $25,550.49, 
rebate of $1,000.00 and discount of $14,000.00. 

SECTION 2. That part 
Power Equipment, marked Exhibit 
part hereof, is hereby accepted 

2 Hover Mowers 
1 Sod Cutter 

for a total cost of $4,795.00. 

of the bid submitted by Xenia 
11B11 , attached hereto and made a 
for the following equipment: 

$1,800.00 
2,995.00 

SECTION 3. That the following equipment be purchased 
through contract with the Department of Administrative Services: 

2 Light Duty Utility Vehicles 8,650.00 
2 Light Duty Utility Vehicles 9 1 200.00 
3 out Front Rotary Mowers 41,604.00 
1 John Deere Tractor 12,939.00 

I for a total cost of $72,393.00. 

SECTION 4 The City Manager is hereby authorized and 
directed to enter into any necessary contracts to evidence 
acceptance of said bids and to make payments pursuant thereto. 

1994. 
PASSED this 2. '-'T¼ day of __ ~x=....,l~::....:\.o::..1.=-• '-'="'t:.lJ-=--'7.,_ _____ , 

ATTEST: 

C~ik£~fo tFi~\~j~i~rd,1: ~he 
City of Centerville, Ohio 

CERTIFICATE 

The undersigned, Clerk of the council of the City of 
Centerville, Ohio, hereby certifies that the foregoing is a true 
and correct copy of Resolution Number 2.. l - °' ~ , passed by the 
Council of the City of Centerville, Ohio, on the "'2. ~ -\-\..-i day of 

l=='i...lo VI.,; l::-"·:Z I 1994 • 

~ -.o ~':&-e.~ .. 
Clerk 'tSf Counc 

Approved as to form, consistency 
with the Charter and Constitutional Provisions. 

Department of Law 
Robert N. Farquhar 
Municipal Attorney 
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YANKEE TRACE GOLF COURSE 

EQUIPMENT BID SHEET 

EXHIBIT 11A11 

The f ollO"Mng Is the list of the items to be bid on. The1number to the right of each Item 

represents the maximum number of units the city may eled to purchase. Bidders are not 

required to bid on every Item, only those that they can supply. Bidders are required to give a unit 

price for each Item they can supply. The total price should rened the unit price mulUplied by the 

number or each Item. The city reserves the right to rejed any and all bids; to waive any and 

all irregularities in a bid, and to accept that bid or bids, Ylllch in Its judgement Is In the best 

Interest to the City of Centerville. The city also reserves the right to accept that bid or bids 

Yllich in Its opinion, Is considered the lmwst and best bid. For more Information refer to the 

"Instructions to Bidders" sheet. 

ITEM UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

$5,278.00 $31,722.00 
WALK BEHIND GREENS MOWER (6) 

$15,944.00 $47,832.00 
TRIPLEX GREENS MOWER (3) 

FIVEPLEXFAIRWAY MOWER (3) 
$24,762.00 $74,286.00 
$22,725.00 $45,450.00 

GOLF COURSE SPRAYER (2) 
P1 $12,400.00 $31,100.00 

HEAVY DUTY WORK VEHICLE (2} /1.2 $39,300.00 

RIDING BUNKER RAKE (1} 
$10,861.00 $10,861 . 00 

THATCHER/SEEDER (2) 
$ 4,733.00 $ 9,466 . 00 

GREENS AERATOR (2) 
$ 9,995.00 $19,990 . 00 

WATER INJECTING AERATOR (1) 
$22,748.00 $22,748.00 

$23,135.00 $23,135.00 
TOW BEHIND FAIRWAY AERATOR (1) 

PTO DRIVEN BLOWER (1) $ 3,224 . 00 $ 3,224 ~00 
• •i1 $10,845.00 $10,845.00 

TURF SWEEPER (1) 
$ 750 . 00 $1,500.00 

HOVER MOWER (2) 

REEL SPIN GRINDER (1) 
$11,995 . 00 $11,995.QO 
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BEDKNIFE GRINDER (1) 
$ a,·49s.oo 

CORE DESTROYER (2) i 21867.00 

COMPACT UTILITY TRIPLEX (2) 11j1289.00 

SODCUTTER (1) 
No Bid 

HAND PUSH ROTARY MOWERS (2) s 2~5 OD 
Out front Rotary . Mower ( 3) $16, 88u·;oo 
Light Duty Unility Vehicle (4) 01 $4,325.00 

#2 $4,600.00 
:rractor ( 1 ) 

Total 

$ 8,495.00 

$ 5,734.00 

$26,578,00 
No Bid 

$ 1 ,49D DD 

$50,640·.00 : 

$17,850.00 

No Bid 

$457,791.00 
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YANKEE TRACE GOLF COURSE 

EQUIPMENT BID SHEET 

EXHIBIT 11811 
Ce,de,u./le /YI,// 
Xente;,. Powt!r Eiv.•f· 

ttJ,I lJ,lsot11 
C rc,.,j Fry_,rt(i./\ 
Dett'\ w,lso('\ 

The f ollov.ing Is the list of the Items to be bid on. The number to the right of each Item 
.I 

represents the maximum number of units the city may elect to purchase. Bidders are not 

required to bid on every Item, only those that they can supply. Bidders are required to give a unit 

price for each Item they can supply. The total price should reflect the unit price multiplied by the 

number of each item. The city reserves the right to reject any and all bids; to waive any and 

all irregulariUes in a bid, and to accept that bid or bids, \\tlich In Its Judgement Is In the best 

interest to the City of Centerville. The city also reserves the right to accept that bid or bids 

v.tlich In its opinion, Is considered the lowest and best bid. For more lnfonnation refer to the 

"Instructions to Bidders" sheet. 

ITEM UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE 

WALK BEHIND GREENS MOWER (6) $3877 $23,262 

TRIPLEX GREENS MOWER (3) $15,500 $46,500 

FIVEPLEX FAIRWAY MOWER (3) $19,750 $59,250 

GOLF COURSE SPRAYER (2) $19,600 $39,200 

HEAVY DUTY WORK VEHICLE (2) 
$9585 
$10,929 $20,5]4 

RIDING BUNKER RAKE (1) ~7028 $7028 

THATCHER/SEEDER (2) $5300 $10,600 

GREENS AERATOR (2) $8650 .!!1.,_300 

WATER INJECTING AERATOR (1) $12,500 $12,500 

TOW BEHIND FAIRWAY AERATOR (1) iNO BID NO BID 
PTO DRIVEN BLOWER (1) $3125 $3125 

TURF SWEEPER (1) $9875 $9875 

HOVER MOWER (2) $900 .ueoo 
REEL SPIN GRINDER (1) $]0.250 $]0,250 . 
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BEDKNIFE GRINDER (1) 

CORE DESTROYER (2) 

COMPACT UTILITY TRIPLEX (2) 

SODCUTTER (1) 

HANO PUSH ROTARY MOWERS (2) 

ADDENDUM# 2 

Ill 

1- OUT FRONT ROTARY MOWER (3) 

2- TRACTOR (1) 

$6805 

NO BID 

$)3,824 

$2995 

$799 

GRAND TOTAL 

3- LIGHT DUTY UTILITY VEHICLE (4) 

$10,296 

$12,939 

$5929 

$6805 

NO BID 

$27 648 

$2995 

$)598 

$;30,888 

$12,939 

$23,716 

** ALL ADDENDuA
2

P~ICES ARE JOHN DEERE STATE CONTRACT PRICES. 

GRAND TOTAL $36"P93 

*** IF TOTAL AMOUNT PURCHASED, EXCLUDING EQUIPMENT AT STATE 
CONTRACT PRICES, EXCEEDS $100,000, A 2% DISCOUNT WILL 
BE AWARDED. 

*** THE JOHN DEERE PROMISE 

IF AFTER 30 DAYS OR 100 HOURS, YOU ARE NOT SATISFIED 
WITH A JOHN DEERE REEL MOWER, WE WILL TAKE IT BACK, 
NO QUESTIONS ASKED! 

. .. 
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XENIA POWER EQUIPMENT 
1855 BELLBROOK AVENUE 
XENIA, OHIO 45385 

- - -

l .... ~ .... l~"'I~:-:-:.;: • .-.., •:•.••~ ~ ,: ! ~ -i,"'~•••~•~t:_:"t~~"':;."':•:~;•. • ~ >.._ ""'2.~r-,/if-:-:. ,._ f ~ ~ • ~ - ~ • ~' :;_•,- > • • • .:.• ; • • • • •::~. D lE4/JEHSHIP 
ATWORK• 

ITEM 

WALK BEHIND GREENS MOWER 

TRIPLEX GREENS MOWER 

FIVEPLEX FAIRWAY MOWER 

GOLF COURSE SPRAYER 

HEAVY DUTY WORK VEHICLE 

RIDING BUNKER RAKE 

THATCHER/SEEDER 

GREENS AERATOR' 

WATER INJECTING AERATOR 

PTO DRIVEN BLOWER 

. 

JOHN DEERE MODEL 22 
*FREQUENCY OF CLIP 0.189-in 
*9 BLADED REEL 

JOHN DEERE 2243 
*18 HP LIQUID COOLED ENGINE 
*OFF SET CUTTING UNITS 
*HYDROSTATIC TRANSAXLE, NO HOSES 

TO WHEEL MOTORS, LESS CHANCE FOR LEAKS 
*ROLLERS AVAILABLE IN JUNE 
*NO LEAK DETECTORS 

JOHN DEERE 3215 
*25~ HP 
*HYDRAULIC DOWN PRESSURE 
*ROTATE FOR SERVICE REELS 

JOHN DEERE 1800 
*18 HP LIQUID COOLED ENGINE 
*200 GALLON TANK 
*HYDROSTATIC DRIVE 
*MICRO-TRAC 
*NO SONAR SENSING DEVICE 
*NO CAB 

JOHN DEERE 1800 
*1500LB BED CAPACITY 
*HYDROSTATIC DRIVE 
*BEFCO SPREADER 
*NO AIR COMPRESSOR 

JOHN DEERE 1200 
*BELT DRIVEN TORQUE CONVERTER 
*2 WHEEL DRIVE 
*MID MOUNT SCRAPER BLADE 
*SERRATED EDGE RAKE 

GANDY 48 11 SEEDER 

GREENCARE CORE MASTER 6 

LANDPRIDE MATERIAL INJECTION SYSTEM 

AGRIMETAL BW 360 



XENIA POWER EQUIPMENT 
1855 BELLBROOK AVENUE 
XENIA, OHIO 45385 

ITEM 

TURF SWEEPER 

HOVER MOWER 

REEL SPIN GRINDER 

BEDKNIFE GRINDER 

COMPACT UTILITY TRIPLEX 

SODCUTTER 

•HAND PUSH ROTARY MOWER 

OUT FRONT ROTARY MOWER 

TRACTOR 

LIGHT DUTY UTILITY VEHICLE 

- lEAOERSHIP 
-ATWORK' 

AGRIMETAL PSOOO 
*VACUUM 

FLY-MO 

T.I. INTERNATIONAL 1000 

T.I. INTERNATIONAL 1000 

JOHN DEERE 2653 
*ON BOARD BACKLAPPING 

RYAN 18" JUNIOR 

JOHN DEERE 14SC 

JOHN DEERE F935 WITH 72 11 DECK 

JOHN DEERE 5300 

JOHN DEERE 6x4 GATOR 


